BID 2015-302

CULVERTS
Fergusan National Wholesale 2nd 1s1
Morrison Supply Waterworks Supply Itayes Pipe Coburn's Supply  Wilson culverts Del Zotto
BASE BID "A" Corragated Steel Pipe peice per linear . price perlinear ft.  price perlinear I price perlinear f.  price per Hnear it price per linear . price per linear It
15 1n. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bid SI11L 78 no bid no bid 59125 $8 55 no bid
18 1n. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bad $14358 no bid no bid $11.56 $10.23 no bid
24 1n. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bid SIB 80 no bid no bid $1466 31361 no bid
30 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bid 52400 no bid no bid $i8 52 $1705 no bid
36 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bid $35 30 no bid no bid $22139 $2063 no bid
42 1n. Corrugated Steed Pipe no bid 41 20 ne bid no bid $26 24 $23 84 no bid
48 1n. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bid $4700 no bid no bid $29135 $3175 no bid
54 1n. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bd $53 40 no bid no bid $38 66 $36 85 no bid
60 1n. Corrugated Steel Pipe no bnd $50.30 no bid no bid 54252 $40.48 na bid
661n Corrugated Sieel Pipe 0o knd $89 80 no bid o bid $51.02 $44 52 no bid
72 in. Corrugated Sieel Pipe o bd $97 80 no bid no bid $56 14 $48 57 no bid
78 in. Corrugated Sieel Pipe 1o bvd $105 90 no bid no bud $60 38 §5234 no bid
84 in. Corrugated Sieel Pipe no bud S113 85 no bid no bid $79.96 56738 no bid
90 in. Corrugated Siee! Pipe 0o bed $12145 no bid o bid $85 08 §71209 no bid
86 1n. Cortugated Sice!l Pipe 0o bed $§29.90 no bid no bad $91.03 $768] no bid
108 . Corrugated Steel Pipe na bwd $146 30 e bid no bad $140 40 5679 no bid
120 in. Corrugated Sieel Pipe no tnd 5288 30 no bid no bad 3162 B4 512917 no bid
Total Base Bid "A" $1.399.50 540,00 581166
Aspahlt Coating ma bid Site no bid no bsd 5025 perin. cha. no bid no bid
Polymer Conting na bid St no bid no bid 25% 40% no bid
Alem Stecl Coatng Type 2 na bed 15% no bid o bud 15% 0% no bid
HASE 1D "B Corrugated {smoovih
interior wall) Polyethylene Pipe
2nd 1st
151 polyethylene pape 5789 $8 50 3823 9101 5787 no bid o bid
18 1n. polyethylene pipe st 09 sii.70 557 $1280 1107 no bid na bid
2410, polycthylene pipe 51650 $2045 $i762 31949 51688 o bid na bid
301n. polycthylenc pipe $26 08 32765 $2719 53007 $2605 no bd no bid
361n. polycthylene pipe 53426 $3770 33573 $3952 $3424 no bad no bid
421n. polycthylene pipe 4410 $4800 346 00 $50 87 $H09 no bad no bid
48.1n. polycthylene pipe $5295 $61 85 $35 26 sol 1} $5297 no bad no bid
15 1n. polycthylenc coupling 51310 $2230 $1432 $1600 $9 55 no bid no ud
18 1n. polyethylene coupling 52198 29490 §2441 $2700 51515 no bid no bud
24.n. polyethylene coupling $31.02 $57 75 $3442 $3800 521 30 no bid o bid
30 in. polyethylene coupling 57210 2410 $80.02 $BE 00 $49 46 no bid no id
361n. polyethylene coupling 590 54 S0 1% 10719 $12200 $68 85 ro bid no nd
42 i $147 81 3164.65 $162.95 £179.00 510081 no bid no bid
Total Buse Bid "H* $56%.82 5$706.60 $4624.91 $692.97 S458.29
HASE BID "C" Reinforced Concrete Pipe 2nd ist
15 in. roin- concrete pipe no bid S1825 na bid no bid ne bid o bd $1510
18 in. rein concrete pipe no bid §2150 no bid no bid no bid no id S8 60
24 in rein conerete pipe no nd 53340 no bid nobid no bid no bid $28.00
30 0. rein concrete pipe no bid 55745 no hid no bid no bid no bid $42.50
36 In. rein. conerete pipe no bid 556 60 no bid no bid no bid no bid $54.99
42in rein congrete pipe no bid 594 45 no bid no bid no bid no bid $78.00
48 in. rein_concrete pipe no bid $112 65 no bid no bid no bid no bid $93.00
Tutal BASE BID "C" $H0530 3330.19
BASE BIIY " D" Reivforced Cincrete
Pipe FOB Place of Marmufucturer 2nd 1st
15 n. rein concrete pipe no bd $17.85 o bid no bid no bad no bid 51475
18 in. remn concrele pipe no bid $21.80 no bid no bid no bid no bnd $S18.00
24in.rein conerete pipe no nd $3265 no bid no bid no bid nobid 52700
30:n rein. concrete pipe no bed $5025 o bid no bid no bed no bid $41.50
36 in_rein concrete pipe no bed 36515 no bid no bad o brd no bid $53 80
42n ren concrele pipe no bid 59175 no bid no bid no trd no bid $7575
48 in_rein, concrele pips iy bre) 5111.20 no bid no bid no bid no bid $91 80

Total RASE HID "D” 530065 I160



