RFP# 2022-13
Tires, Tubes and Service for Gregg County, Texas

Southern Tire Auto Motive
Tire Size Mart Good Year Tire  Super Center
P265-70R17 $145.27 $129.95 $203.00
P265-60R17 $132.23 $132.20 $381.00
LT245-75R16 $122.94 $136.45 $245.00
P235-55R17 $118.60 $124.00 $275.00
P225-60R16 $107.33 $112.21 $145.00
P235-50R18 $139.35 $158.42 $206.00
P255-65R17 $113.35 $122.20 No Bid
11R22.5 $322.24 $378.61 No Bid
11R24.5 $343.84 $401.32 No Bid
ST235/85R16 $135.00 $133.59 $179.00
245/70R19.5 $291.10 $324.31 No Bid
P225/75R16 $120.19 $87.37 $196.00
225/70R19.5 $280.60 $308.40 No Bid
10.00-20 $750.00 No Bid No Bid
15.5-25L $635.00 No Bid No Bid
17.5R 25 $1,135.00 $1,636.60 No Bid
320/85R24 $677.05 No Bid No Bid
P275/55R20 $117.00 $152.88 $269.00
P275/60R20 $126.46 $129.65 $270.00
20.5/R25 $1,428.00 $1,885.10 No Bid
380/85R24 $840.02 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5/14RR $343.84 $420.63 No Bid
215/75R17.5 $249.88 $266.77 No Bid
235/80R16 $135.00 $121.32 No Bid
225/75R15 $88.35 $98.12 $159.00
235/R15 $112.73 No Bid No Bid
7.50/15 $140.00 No Bid No Bid
245/70R17 $116.26 $140.89 $214.99
235/80R17 $136.42 $161.38 $212.95

245/75R17 $143.30 $111.89 $244.00



RFP# 2022-13
Tires, Tubes and Service for Gregg County, Texas

10R22.5/12PR $317.35 $373.02 No Bid
18.4R30 $1,075.39 No Bid No Bid
245/55R18 $139.05 $139.54 $395.00
275/55R20 $175.34 $149.96 $472.00
265/60R17 $132.33 $148.00 $380.00
LT275/70R18 $172.19 $185.41 $299.00
255/70R17 $140.85 $143.94 $224.00
LT245/75R17 $143.30 $159.04 $244.00
LT235/80R17 $136.42 $161.38 $234.00
9.00-20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 $359.35 $456.35 No Bid
17.5-24 $787.50 No Bid No Bid
19.5L-24 $538.00 $744.10 No Bid
ST225/75 R15 $95.00 $98.12 $159.00
255/80R22.5 $283.36 No Bid No Bid
14.00-24 $533.00 $595.00 No Bid
17.5R25XHA $1,135.00 No Bid No Bid
18.4-30 $664.41 No Bid No Bid
7.5-15NHS $140.00 No Bid No Bid
18.4-26 12PLY $1,368.97 No Bid No Bid
LT235/75R15 $112.73 $158.74 $196.00
460/85R34 $860.71 No Bid No Bid
16.9-30 $550.52 No Bid No Bid
16.9-24 $669.80 $669.90 No Bid
6.50-10 IND SOLID No Bid No Bid No Bid
7-14.5LY No Bid No Bid No Bid
LT265/70R17 $167.29 $160.60 $247.00
225/60R16 $108.79 $78.68 $137.00
255/70R17 $140.85 $143.94 $225.00
LT245/70R17 $139.47 $155.01 $215.00

Total  $20,633.32 $12,394.99 $6,626.94



RFP# 2022-13
Tires, Tubes and Service for Gregg County, Texas

Souther Tire Auto Motive

Service Mart Good Year Tire Super Center
Tire installation w/ purchase
in store includes dismount of Lt $15.00 LT $15.00
used tires and tubes. Med $3]5 00 HT & Car (in $80.00 set/all 4
' stock) $25.00
LT $15.00
Change tire, dismount and NI[Jt d$;§:508 0 HT & Car (in $10.00
mount. © ' stock) $25.00
LT $15.00
Flat repair, remove, repair and ML:1$$93'§% 0 HT & Car (in Free
mount. © ' stock) $25.00
Flat repair, off vehicle. Lt $9.50 Lt $15.00 Fr
Med $38.00 Med $30.00 ©
Rotate mounted tires (per Lt $0.00
tire). Med $20.00 $10.00 In Store $25.00 set/all 4
New valve stem rubber or $5.95 $2.50 No Bid
metal.
Wheel balance, computer spin
balance (per tirc). Lt $15.00 $25.00 $60.00 set/all 4
Med $38.00
Wheel balance, computer spin
balance and valve stem LT $15.00
$25.00 $90.00 set/all 4
combination. MT $40.00




Tires, Tubes and Service for Gregg County, Texas

RFP# 2022-13

Souther Tire

Auto Motive

Service Mart Good Year Tire Super Center
Car $59.95
Truck $79.95
Labor (per hr)
$75.00
Medium Truck
Alignment services F$rc1)r612 %r(l)d No Bid $109.95
3 axles $270.00
Camber Set
$135.00
Labor (per hr)
$85.00
Emergency tire repair: Road $85.00 Regular
side assistance (price per hour Hours
for labor or service call). §75.00 $95.00 After No Bid
Hours
(includes all labor,
M/D, flat repairs)
Used tire recycle and disposal
fee (per tire). $4.00 LT 35.00 $2.50

HT $8.00




Tires, Tubes and Service for Gregg County, Texas

RFP# 2022-13

Southern Tire GoodYear Tire
Mart & Rubber Auto Motive
Service Questions Company Super Store
6.50-10 IND
Solid Firestone
1. Does the vendor offer all of All Season
the tires listed in the bid? If Genere}I, /- The ones that say
not, which ones are not 14.3LT Firestone no bid Yes
offered? All Season
General, 9.00-20
Firestone All
Season General
2. Does the vendor agree to
provide a one year warranty
on all tubes and parts Yes Yes No Bid
beginning on the date of
installation?
3. Does the vendor agree to
give emergency vehicles Yes Yes Yes

priority service ?
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