RFP# 2018-804
Tires, Tubes and Service Bid Tab

Tire Size East TX Tire Gateway Tire GCR GoodYear  Goolsbee Tire Kilgore Tire  Southern Tire
P265-70R17 $145.00 $133.53 $112.82 $114.92 $112.00 wm 13.76 $115.00
P265-60R17 $390.34 $133.53 $117.36 $135.00 $117.00 $138.40 $123.00
LT245-75R16 $125.00 $139.99 $110.11 $115.00 $110.00 $127.19 $111.50
P235-55R17 $332.12 $330.95 $105.38 $110.00 $105.00 $90.85 $110.00
P225-60R16 $256.14 $229.95 $94.65 $95.00 $92.00 $84.53 $96.00
P235-50R18 $425.22 $405.00 $132.05 $135.00 $132.00 $121.66 $138.00
P255-65R17 $149.00 $169.95 $105.62 $101.46 $105.00 $124.03 $107.00
11R22.5 $452.12 $496.31 $284.16 $301.00 $284.00 $326.39 $304.00
11R24.5 $439.73 $517.44 $310.67 $320.00 $310.00 $353.59 $322.00
ST235/85R16 $168.00 $141.80 no bid $146.30 $85.00 $66.00 $103.46
245/70R 19.5 $301.99 $389.99 $222.11 $222.26 $243.22 $236.83 $236.00
P225/75R16 $110.00 $149.99 $111.53 $106.00 $98.00 $90.06 $96.00
225/70R19.5 $312.14 $389.99 $228.28 $209.56 $211.00 $204.44 $208.00
10.00-20 $326.15 no bid no bid $575.00 $495.00 $741.00 $310.69
15.5-25L $733.00 no bid $587.16 $1,200.00 $445.00 $1,058.40 $587.00
17.5R 25 $801.51 no bid $914.76 $1,200.00 $485.00 $1,154.40 $942.00
320/85R24 $677.89 no bid $512.04 $838.42 $450.00 $564.98 $553.00
Total $6,145.35 $3,628.42 $3,948.70  $5,924.92 $3,879.22 $5,596.51 $4,462.65



Tires, Tubes and Service Bid Tab

RFP# 2018-804

Service East TX Tire Gateway Tire GCR GoodYear  Goolsbee Tire ﬁ_mc..m Tire Southern Tire
Tire installation
w/ purchase in
store includes $13.00 $10.00 Eaﬁm.oo Lt $15.00 Lt $10.00 Lt m_m.momo Lt $7.50
dismount of used Med $30.00 | Med $25.00 Med $15.00 Med $25. Med $25.00
tires and tubes.
Ch tire,
&mhmwmhm g $4.00 $15.00 Lt$20.00 | Lt$15.00 Lt $10.00 Lt $15.00 Lt $7.50
. ) ’ Med $32.00 | Med $25.00 Med $15.00 Med $25.00 Med $25.00
Flat ir, )
aaw,\w_w_w: $13.00 m_w 3 o_wawha .”___w Lt$22.00 | Lt$25.00 Lt $17.50 Lt $15.00 Lt $8.50
- feP : Pencing on 1 n1ed $42.00 | Med $35.00 | Med$22.50 | Med $25.00 |  Med $27.00
and mount. size
Flat repair, off Lt $18.00 Lt $15.00 Lt $17.50 Lt $10.00 Lt $8.50
By $13.00 | $10.00andup | /163500 | Med $25.00 | Med $22.50 | Med$15.00 |  Med $27.00
Rotate mounted $4.00 (free
. . , Lt $5.00 . Lt $3.50 Lt no charge
t . H H
tires (per tire) witire $20.00 Med $25.00 $10.00 no bid Med $5.00 Med $14.50
purchase)
New valve stem $3.00 reg/
Lt $6.00 Lt $3.50 Lt $3.00
bb tal. X . . .
rubber or meta $10 o.whouﬁ_o_.. $5.00 Med $9.00 $5.50 Med $4.00 Med $5.00 $4.95
Wheel balance,
computer spin Lt $18.00 Lt $10.00 Lt $15.00 Lt $7.00
balance (per tire). ALY $10.00ea |\ ig3000| IO Med $15.00 | Med$2000 | Med $27.00
Wheel balance,
computer spin
balance and valve
A Lt $10.00 Lt $18.00 Lt$11.00
e AEALL ALY 9L £ Med $15.00 | Med$25.00 | Med$32.00

combination.




Tires, Tubes and Service Bid Tab

RFP# 2018-804

Service East TX Tire Gateway Tire GCR GoodYear  Goolsbee Tire  Kilgore Tire  Southern Tire
Alignment
services Car $49.95
Truck $69.95
Labor (per hr)
$65.00
awm_w.ﬁm Medium Truck
wom\ ﬁmmo no bid no bid no bid no bid $59.95 | Front End $150.00
v 3 axles $240.00
labor $70/hr Camber Set
$125.00
Labor (per hr)
$75.00
Emergency tire
repair: Road side $85.00/h
assistance (price . . Lt $60.00 ; rreg ) Lt $50.00
per hour for labor $45 + repair no bid Med $60.00 $95.00/hr no bid Med $75.00 $55.00
or service call). after hrs
Used tire recycle $3.50
\ . Lt $5.00 Lt $5.00 Lt $3.50 Lt $3.00
dd 1 f .
and disposal fee $3.00 | dependingon | \\ 161000| Med$8.00 | Med$6.00 | Med $9.00 2L
(per tire). size




RFP# 2018-804
Tires, Tubes and Service Bid Tab

Service Questions East TX Tire Gateway Tire GCR GoodYear  Goolsbee Tire Kilgore Tire  Southern Tire

ST235/85R1

6 10.00/20

1. Does the Yes, but Excavator,
vendor offer all of 10.00-12 will Firestone The brands listed
the tires listed in be a does not Ido stock or have
the bid? If not, comparable No Response manufacture Yes available next No Response Yes
which ones are worth tire, but these sizes. day.
not offered? not Firestone. We do have

them in other

brands.
2. Does the
vendor agree to
provide a one year All parts, but See Attached
warranty on all . \
tubes will No Response Yes Yes Yes No Response | Manufacturer's

tubes and parts depend on use Warrant
beginning on the pe ' Y
date of
installation?
3. Does the
vendor agree to
give emergency Absolutely | No Response Yes Yes N/A No Response Yes

vehicles priority
service ?




