BASE BID "B"

I5 in. polyethylene pipe

18 in. polyethylene pipe

24 in. polyethylene pipe

30 in. polyethylene pipe

36 in. polyethylene pipe

42 in. polyethylene pipe

48 in. polyethylene pipe

15 in. polyethylene coupling
18 in. polyethylene coupling
24 in. polyethylene coupling
30 in. polyethylene coupling
36 in. polyethylene coupling
42 in. polyethylene coupling
BASE BID "A"

15 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
18 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
24 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
30 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
36 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
42 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
48 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
54 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
60 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
66 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
72 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
78 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
84 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
90 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
96 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
108 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe
120 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe

Coburns
price per linear fi.

$8.60
$12.09
$18.42
$28.40
$37.33
$48.05
$57.72
$14.80
$25.22
$35.57
$82.66
$115.02
$168.35

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

Bid 2016-601
Culverts

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

Wilson Culverts

East Texas Lumber

price per linear ft. price per linear ft.

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

$16.00
$20.00
$24.00
$30.00
$16.00
$20.00
$24.00
$30.00
$30.00
$16.00
$20.00
$24.00
$20.00
$24.00



